

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/5/2021	JFH Telephone conference with Superintendent re: employee matter; review and reply to correspondence from CTO re: bidding process, potential protests	1.50 \$215.00/hr	\$322.50
3/8/2021	PJL Review Motions to Set Aside Bond Forfeiture to determine whether to file an objection; research re: evidence attached to MTSAs	0.50 \$115.00/hr	\$57.50
	JFH Draft correspondence re: employee matter, correspondence with Superintendent re: same; review and reply to correspondence from employee re: employee matter, telephone conference with Superintendent re: same (.25 not billed)	2.50 \$215.00/hr	\$537.50
3/9/2021	AFL Draft Title IX Investigation Report template per client's request	2.00 \$200.00/hr	\$400.00
	JFH Review policies re: Title IX investigation process, telephone conference with investigator re: same	1.50 \$215.00/hr	\$322.50
3/10/2021	KLC Review motion to set aside forfeiture for potential objection	0.25 \$200.00/hr	\$50.00
	JFH Review bid protest process, documentation of bidding process and documents, telephone conference with CTO re: same	2.50 \$215.00/hr	\$537.50
3/12/2021	JFH Telephone conference with Superintendent re: employee matter, legal matter, draft employee correspondence re: same; review draft investigative Title IX report, correspondence with Asst. Superintendent re: same	2.50 \$215.00/hr	\$537.50
3/15/2021	KLC Analyze proposed revisions to Board Policy 2310 - Public Participation, draft potential guidance re: handling complaints	0.25 \$200.00/hr	\$50.00
	AFL Analyze and review Title IX matter	0.25 \$200.00/hr	\$50.00
	JFH Draft and revise correspondence re: employee matter, telephone conference with Superintendent re: same; review policy, correspondence with Title IX investigator re: same	5.00 \$215.00/hr	\$1,075.00
	KLC Research and analyze Supreme Court orders re: state of emergency and bond forfeiture motions and hearings (time divided among multiple clients)	0.50 \$200.00/hr	\$100.00
3/16/2021	PJL Review Motions to Set Aside Bond Forfeiture to determine whether to file an objection; research re: evidence attached to MTSAs	0.50 \$115.00/hr	\$57.50
	JFH Review correspondence re: employee matter; review documents re: bidding and contract matter; round-trip travel to Forest City, attend special meeting re: SB220/S.L. 2021-4, transition to Plan A, review guidance re: same in preparation to advise client (1.0 not billed)	3.00 \$215.00/hr	\$645.00

**CAMPBELL SHATLEY, PLLC**

674 MERRIMON AVENUE SUITE 210 ASHEVILLE, NC 28804

Mr. Chad Calhoun  
Mitchell County Schools  
72 Ledger School Road  
Bakersville, NC 28705

In Reference To: General Matters  
Invoice # 8358

## Professional Services

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/3/2021	JFH Telephone conference with Federal Programs Director re: student records matter	0.25 \$215.00/hr	\$53.75
3/4/2021	JFH Telephone conference with Federal Programs Director re: student records matter	0.25 \$215.00/hr	\$53.75
3/8/2021	JFH Review proposed MOA re: in-school dental services; telephone conference with Superintendent re: employee matter	1.00 \$215.00/hr	\$215.00
3/9/2021	PJL Review Motions to Set Aside Bond Forfeiture to determine whether to file an objection; research re: evidence attached to MTSA's	0.25 \$115.00/hr	\$28.75
	JFH Telephone conference with Superintendent re: employee matter	0.50 \$215.00/hr	\$107.50
3/10/2021	KLC Review motion to set aside forfeiture for potential objection	0.25 \$200.00/hr	\$50.00
	PJL Prepare objection to motion to set aside bond forfeiture; telephone conference with deputy clerk re: scheduling same; serve objection on all parties and deputy clerk for filing	0.75 \$115.00/hr	\$86.25
3/11/2021	JFH Telephone conference with Superintendent re: agenda item, employee matter; review policy drafts for review with client; round-trip travel to Bakersville, attend regular Board meeting (.75 not billed)	5.50 \$215.00/hr	\$1,182.50
3/15/2021	KLC Analyze proposed revisions to Board Policy 2310 - Public Participation, draft potential guidance re: handling complaints	0.25 \$200.00/hr	\$50.00
	JFH Correspondence with Superintendent, partner agency for student dental services	0.25 \$215.00/hr	\$53.75
	KLC Research and analyze Supreme Court orders re: state of emergency and bond forfeiture motions and hearings (time divided among multiple clients)	0.50 \$200.00/hr	\$100.00



**CAMPBELL SHATLEY, PLLC**

674 MERRIMON AVENUE SUITE 210 ASHEVILLE, NC 28804

Dr. Chris Baldwin  
Macon County Schools  
1202 Old Murphy Road  
Franklin, NC 28734

In Reference To: General Matters

Invoice # 8357

Professional Services

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/3/2021	KLC	Review correspondence from lienholder re: seized vehicle	0.25 \$190.00/hr	\$47.50
	PJL	Review Motions to Set Aside Bond Forfeiture to determine whether to file an objection	0.25 \$115.00/hr	\$28.75
3/4/2021	PJL	Review Motions to Set Aside Bond Forfeiture to determine whether to file an objection; research re: evidence attached to MTSA's	0.25 \$115.00/hr	\$28.75
3/9/2021	JFH	Meeting with administration re: employee matter; draft release forms for equipment donations	1.00 \$210.00/hr	\$210.00
3/10/2021	JFH	Correspondence with architect re: contract documents	0.25 \$210.00/hr	\$52.50
3/15/2021	KLC	Analyze proposed revisions to Board Policy 2310 - Public Participation, draft potential guidance re: handling complaints	0.25 \$190.00/hr	\$47.50
	JFH	Telephone conference with County Finance Officer re: construction contract matter	0.50 \$210.00/hr	\$105.00
	CZC	Research and analyze Supreme Court orders re: state of emergency and bond forfeiture motions and hearings (time divided among multiple clients)	0.50 \$210.00/hr	\$105.00
3/17/2021	JFH	Telephone conference with Superintendent re: legal matter; review and reply to correspondence from bond counsel in school project, draft deed and documentation for same, telephone conference with bond counsel and Board Assistant re: same (.25 not billed)	2.50 \$210.00/hr	\$525.00
3/18/2021	JFH	Review construction project documents, draft addendum document, correspondence to County Attorney re: same	2.25 \$210.00/hr	\$472.50
3/22/2021	KLC	Review motion to set aside forfeiture for potential objection	0.25 \$190.00/hr	\$47.50