

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	Remote Learning Contingency Plan template; and conduct client informational session re: same (time divided among multiple clients		
8/18/2020	JFH Telephone conference with Superintendent re: rehiring retired teacher, review applicable session law re: same	0.75 \$215.00/hr	\$161.25
	AFL Back to School Advisor #3: Return to work and work from home	0.25 \$200.00/hr	\$50.00
8/19/2020	CSL Review status of law regarding full-time employment of retired teacher	0.25 \$215.00/hr	\$53.75
	JFH Further research, consult with CSL, telephone conference with Superintendent re: rehire of retiree teacher, draft correspondence to NCDPI re: same	1.50 \$215.00/hr	\$322.50
8/20/2020	KLC Review motions to set aside forfeiture for potential objection	0.25 \$200.00/hr	\$50.00
	JFH Review and revise in-school nursing contract, correspondence with EC Director re: same; correspondence with Human Resources Director re: employee matter, review statute re: same	1.50 \$215.00/hr	\$322.50
8/24/2020	PJL Review Motions to Set Aside Bond Forfeiture to determine whether to file an objection; ACIS research re: evidence	0.25 \$115.00/hr	\$28.75
8/25/2020	JFH Review contract matter, correspondence with Superintendent re: same	0.25 \$215.00/hr	\$53.75
8/27/2020	JFH Attend NCCOSA conference call re: CARES Act funding (.50 at no charge)	0.00 \$215.00/hr	NO CHARGE
8/31/2020	KLC Review motions to set aside forfeiture for potential objection	0.25 \$200.00/hr	\$50.00
	JFH Telephone conference with claimant re: insurance coverage/claim, telephone conference with Superintendent re: same; correspondence with EC Director re: student matter; telephone conference with Federal Programs Director re: CARES Act funding, review correspondence re: same; round-trip travel to Bakersville, attend special meeting	4.00 \$215.00/hr	\$860.00
	CZC Research, analyze and draft multiple Attorney-Client Memoranda re: allocation of CARES funds to private schools	0.25 \$215.00/hr	\$53.75
For professional services rendered		25.00	\$5,243.75

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/25/2020	PJL Prepare objection to MTSA; review Motions to Set Aside Bond Forfeiture to determine whether to file an objection	0.75 \$115.00/hr	\$86.25
	JFH Review proposed changes to remote learning facility contract, correspondence with Superintendent re: same	0.50 \$210.00/hr	\$105.00
8/27/2020	PJL Review Motions to Set Aside Bond Forfeiture to determine whether to file an objection	0.25 \$115.00/hr	\$28.75
	JFH Telephone conference with Superintendent re: student matter, review files and telephone conference with principal re: same; telephone conference with Superintendent, Human Resources Director, telephone call to counsel for employee re: employee matter	2.50 \$210.00/hr	\$525.00
8/30/2020	PJL Review Motions to Set Aside Bond Forfeiture to determine whether to file an objection; research inmate information	0.25 \$115.00/hr	\$28.75
8/31/2020	CZC Research, analyze and draft multiple Attorney-Client Memoranda re: allocation of CARES funds to private schools	0.25 \$210.00/hr	\$52.50
	For professional services rendered	36.25	\$7,303.75
	Additional Charges :		
8/11/2020	JFH Roundtrip to Franklin		\$80.50
8/17/2020	JFH Roundtrip to Franklin		\$80.50
8/31/2020	KWC NC Administrative Office of the Courts, Access Fee, Invoice 41215549		\$4.41
	Total additional charges		\$165.41
	Total amount of this bill		\$7,469.16

Attorney Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Campbell, Christopher	0.25	210.00	\$52.50
Henning, John	29.00	210.00	\$6,090.00
Caudle, Kristopher	4.50	190.00	\$855.00
Leonard, Ashley	0.25	190.00	\$47.50
Lovitt, Paula	2.25	115.00	\$258.75
Previous balance			\$4,892.25
Accounts receivable transactions			
8/25/2020 Payment - Thank You. Check No. 258697			(\$4,892.25)

Rutherford County Schools

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/29/2020	CZC	Review state guidance in preparation to advise administration re: funding matter; review documents and correspondence re: same and draft correspondence to administration re: funding matter	1.00 \$215.00/hr \$215.00
8/30/2020	KLC	Draft Response to amended motion to set aside forfeiture for hearing set for October 5	1.00 \$200.00/hr \$200.00
	CZC	Correspondence with Finance Officer and Superintendent re: funding matter	0.25 \$215.00/hr \$53.75
8/31/2020	KLC	Draft revisions to Response to amended motion to set aside forfeiture for hearing set for October 5	0.50 \$200.00/hr \$100.00
	JFH	Research re: bond forfeiture matter, conference with KLC re: same; telephone conference with Superintendent re: employee matter; review correspondence re: live-streaming meetings	1.50 \$215.00/hr \$322.50
	CZC	Research, analyze and draft multiple Attorney-Client Memoranda re: allocation of CARES funds to private schools	0.25 \$215.00/hr \$53.75
		For professional services rendered	25.50 \$5,253.75

Attorney Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Campbell, Christopher	8.00	215.00	\$1,720.00
Henning, John	5.25	215.00	\$1,128.75
Shatley, K. Dean	1.25	215.00	\$268.75
Caudle, Kristopher	9.00	200.00	\$1,800.00
Leonard, Ashley	1.25	200.00	\$250.00
Lovitt, Paula	0.75	115.00	\$86.25
Previous balance			\$8,207.05
Accounts receivable transactions			
8/17/2020 Payment - Thank You. Check No. 946687			(\$8,207.05)
Total payments and adjustments			(\$8,207.05)
Balance due			\$5,253.75

CAMPBELL SHATLEY, PLLC

674 MERRIMON AVENUE SUITE 210 ASHEVILLE, NC 28804

Mrs. Kathy Amos
Yancey County Schools
P. O. Box 190
Burnsville, NC 28714

In Reference To: General Matters
Invoice # 7918

Professional Services

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/3/2020	KLC Telephone call with EC Director re: IEP issues for in-person instruction in Fall 2020; review DHHS guidance and correspondence forwarded by EC Director re: same	1.00 \$200.00/hr	\$200.00
	JFH Telephone conference with Superintendent re: employee matter	0.25 \$235.00/hr	\$58.75
8/4/2020	KLC Legal research and review of DHHS guidance re: IEP issues for school re-opening; telephone call to EC Director re: same	0.75 \$200.00/hr	\$150.00
	JFH Prepare presentation materials for administrator in-service	0.50 \$235.00/hr	\$117.50
8/5/2020	JFH Review and review presentation materials; round-trip travel to Burnsville, present in-service materials; consult with Superintendent re: employee matter	3.50 \$235.00/hr	\$822.50
8/14/2020	CZC Correspondence with administration re: student matters	0.25 \$235.00/hr	\$58.75
8/17/2020	JFH Telephone conference with Superintendent re: employee matter, policy matter, correspondence re: same	0.25 \$235.00/hr	\$58.75
8/18/2020	CZC Research, draft and finalize multiple attorney-client memorandum, administrative procedures, and sample notices regarding services to exceptional children under Phase B and Phase C; draft and finalize Remote Learning Contingency Plan template; and conduct client informational session re: same (time divided among multiple clients	2.75 \$235.00/hr	\$646.25
	AFL Back to School Advisor #3: Return to work and work from home	0.25 \$200.00/hr	\$50.00
8/31/2020	CZC Research, analyze and draft multiple Attorney-Client Memoranda re: allocation of CARES funds to private schools	0.25 \$235.00/hr	\$58.75

PAID SEP 30 2020